Commercial Fee Schedule:

Waste

Waste Pro

Comparison- Better (WM), WastePro

. Front End Load Option 3: Individual Billed - City 10% Franchise Fee Option 1: Waste Pro provides billing - 3% FF to city
Front Load 1x Week 2x Week 3x Week 4x Week 5x Week 6x Week 1x Week 2x Week 3x Week 4x Week  |S5x Week [6x Week 1x Week [2x Week |3x Week |4x Week |5x Week 6x Week
2 Yard 45.60 76.20 106.79 137.39 167.99 203.59 95.59 170.31 245.03 319.75 394.47 469.20 (49.99) (94.11)| (138.24)( (182.36) (226.48) (265.61)
4 Yard 76.20 137.39 198.59 259.78 320.98 387.17 117.06 213.25 309.44 405.63 501.82 598.00 (40.86) (75.86)| (110.85)[ (145.85) (180.84) (210.83)
6 Yard 91.79 183.59 275.38 367.17 458.96 570.76 138.53 256.19 373.84 491.50 609.16 726.81 (46.74) (72.60) (98.46)| (124.33) (150.20) (156.05)
8 Yard 112.39 234.78 357.17 479.56 601.95 744.34 160.00 299.12 438.25 577.37 716.50 855.62 (47.61) (64.34) (81.08) (97.81) (114.55) (111.28)
Extra Pick-Up 75.00 75.00 75.00 75.00 75.00 75.00 75.00 75.00 75.00 75.00 75.00 75.00 = = = = = =
Recycle (List Size)
Extra Pick-Up

Option 2: Individual Billed - City 10% Franchise Fee Option 1: Waste Pro provides billing - 3% FF to city
. Front End Load Recycling 1x 2x 3x 4x 5x 1x 2x 3x 4x 5x 1x 2x 3x ax 5x
8 yard - Single Stream 114.50 206.50 298.50 390.50 482.50 160.00 299.12 438.25 577.37 716.50 (45.50) (92.62) (139.75)| (186.87) (234.00)
8 yard - Cardboard Only 114.50 206.50 298.50 390.50 482.50 160.00 299.12 438.25 577.37]  716.50 (45.50)| (92.62)] (139.75)] (186.87)]  (234.00)
. Roll Off & Compactors Option 2: Individual Billed - 10% Franchise Fee to City |Option 1: Waste Pro provides billing - 3% FF to city
Roll-Off Containers Delivery Rental Haul Rate | Disposal / Ton Delivery Rental Haul Rate Disposal / Delivery | Rental Haul | Disposal

Rate Rate Rate Rate Ton Rate Rate Rate / Ton
10 Yard No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 129.00 92.08 158.67 56.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A
20 Yard 45.00 155.25 172.50 57.50 129.00 97.82 158.67 56.00 (84.00) 57.43 13.83 1.50
30 Yard 45.00 155.25 172.50 57.50 129.00 113.11 158.67 56.00 (84.00) 42.14 13.83 1.50
40 Yard 45.00 155.25 172.50 57.50 129.00 126.87 158.67 56.00 (84.00) 28.38 13.83 1.50
Delivery Rental Rental Disposal / Delivery Rental Disposal Delivery | Rental | Rental Haul | Disposal /

Compactors Rate New Used HaullRate Ton Rate New Bentalus=dy [DaullRate / Ton Rate New Used Rate Ton
4 Yard *x 175.00 125.00 367.17 N/A 142.00 218.46 192.04 N/A N/A N/A (43.46) (67.04) N/A N/A
8 Yard ** 175.00 125.00 367.17 N/A 142,00 13184 114,64 1449 ‘fg N/A R ml masl e o
20 Yard 90.00 494.50 368.00 172.50 57.50 142.00 363.67 288.65 198.34 56.00 (52.00)[ 130.83 79.35 (25.84) 1.50
30 Yard 90.00 494.50 368.00 172.50 57.50 142.00 505.51 431.38 198.34 56.00 (52.00) (11.01) (63.38) (25.84) 1.50
40 Yard 90.00 494.50 368.00 172.50 57.50 142.00 223.09 171.20 198.34 56.00 (52.00)[ 271.41 196.80 (25.84) 1.50
. Hillsdale Condos: 450 units
Picked up twice weekly, cans/carts provided by residents.
Containers Per Month
Cans/Carts 26.00
96 Gal Recycle 12.00|1 x per week service




