CITY OF SMYRNA
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
2800 KING STREET
N SMYRNA, GEORGIA 30080

678-631-5337

TO: Chief David Lee

Capt. Joe Bennett
FROM: Penny Murphy, Purchasing Manager
DATE: July 21, 2015

SUBJECT: Recommendation — RFQ 16-003 Handguns & Holsters

Bids were sent to eight suppliers, including those on the State Contract. Bidders were allowed to
submit bids on all or some of the items required. Four (4) bids were received, three including
handguns and one specific to the vests and holsters. The results are below. It is recommended
the award be split between two companices, Smyrna Police Distributors and Red the Uniform

Tailor.
BIDDER PRICE EACH UNIT EXCEPTIONS
Smyrna Police Handgun — Glock $320.50 Bid for $20.50
B Distributors, Inc. Model 43-9MM Extended Price for Telor Vest
‘ Single stack 103 units= $33,011.50 Holster as
handgun substitute
Handgun w/Fixed $320.50
gy Sights Extended Price Same
: as Above
Handgun w/Night $368.60 No other
Sights Extended Price for exceptions
103 units =
$37,965.80
‘ Vest Holsters- No Bid
| Gladius Substituted Telor
| Ankle Holsters — $34.00
‘ Telor
| Extra Ankle Straps | $3.50
Shipping Charge No Charge
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GT Distributors of Handgun — Glock $320.50 No Exceptions
Georgia, Inc. Model 43-9MM Bid only Handguns

Single stack

handgun

Handgun w/Fixed $320.50

Sights

Handgun w/Night $368.60

Sights

Vest Holsters- No Bid

Gladius

Ankle Holsters — No Bid

Telor

Extra Ankle Straps | No Bid

Shipping Charge No Charge
Ed’s Public Safety

Handgun — Glock $320.50 Bidfor | $23.00

Model 43-9MM Telor

Single stack Vest

handgun Holsters

Handgun w/Fixed $320.50

Sights

Handgun w/Night $368.60

Sights

Vest Holsters- No Bid

Gladius Substituted Telor

Ankle Holsters — $41.99

Telor

Extra Ankle Straps | $3.50

Shipping Charge No Charge

Handgun — Glock No Bid None
Red the Uniform Tailor Model 43-SMM

Single stack

handgun

Handgun w/Fixed No Bid

Sights

Handgun w/Night No Bid

Sights

Vest Holsters- $48.99

Gladius

Ankle Holsters — $44.89

Telor

Extra Ankle Straps | $3.75

Shipping Charge No Charge
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It is the recommendation of the Purchasing Department that this bid is to be awarded between
two companies. For the Gladius Vest Holders, we recommend low bidder, Red the Uniform
Tailor; and for all other items, including Handguns, Ankle Holsters and Extra Straps, we
recommend Smyrna Police Distributors, Inc., adhering to our local vendor preference practice.

Please prepare any necessary paperwork to present to Mayor and Council for approval. We will

then prepare a Purchase Requisition and complete contract work/purchase order for these
services.
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